ORDINANCE NO. 12-06
TOWN OF QUEENSTOWN
AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF QUEENSTOWN ADOPTING THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE AND THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE-AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, AS MODIFIED BY THE MARYLAND BUILDING PERFORMANCE STANDARDS, AND AS FURTHER AMENDED BY THIS ORDINANCE, AS THE 
QUEENSTOWN BUILDING CODE.
Introduced By:  Perry A. Stutman, President
Section 1.
Adoption

Section 2.
Building Code -Amendments

Section 3.
One and Two Family Dwelling Code-Amendments

Section 4.
Penalties

Section 1.
Adoption.

Except as otherwise amended by the Maryland Building Performance Standards as set forth in the Code of Maryland Regulations (05.02.07) and as further amended by this Ordinance, the following codes are hereby adopted as the Building Code for The Town of Queenstown as if the Codes were set out in full in this title:

(1)
The International Building Code 2012 Edition published by the International Code Council, Inc. 

(2)
The International Residential Code for One and Two Family Dwellings 2012 Edition published by the International Code Council, Inc.

(3)
International Mechanical Code 2012 Edition published by the International Code Council, Inc.

(4)
The Life Safety Code 2012 Edition published by the National Fire Protection Association.

(5)
The National Electrical Code (NFPA 70) most recent Edition and as amended by NFPA every three (3) years.

(6)
The Maryland “State Plumbing Code” set forth in COMAR 09.20.01.01.
(7)
The Maryland State Accessibility Code, Code of Md. Regulations 05.02.02.

Section 2.  Building Code - Amendments.

The provisions of the International Building Code, 2012 Edition as incorporated in COMAR 05.02.07 are modified, deleted, substituted, or added to as follows:

(1)  In general.

(a)
The term "code official" as used in this Code means the designee of the Commissioners of Queenstown. 
(b)
Where the name of the jurisdiction is to be indicated in any section of this Code, insert "The Town of Queenstown, Maryland".

(c)
The term "Department of Building Inspection" as used in this Code means the designated building inspector of the Commissioners of Queenstown.
(d)  
The term “board of appeals” shall refer to the Queenstown Board of Appeals. 
(2) 101.2.1. Appendices. Delete all appendices. 
(3)
105.1.1.  Annual Permit.  Delete entirely, and replace with the following:
105.1.1.  Substantial Improvement.  Anytime a structure is enlarged, altered, repaired, improved, or moved, which equals or exceeds  fifty percent (50%) of the market value of the structure, before the improvements are started the entire structure shall be brought up to code. 
(4)
105.1.2.  Annual Permit Records.  Delete entirely.
(5)
107.2.1.  Information on Construction documents.  Add new paragraph to Subsection 107.2.1. to read as follows:

107.2.1. Information on Construction documents.

The application for the building permit shall be accompanied by plans and specifications as follows:

1.  Detached one and two family dwellings:

2 sets of drawings drawn to scale with sufficient clarity and detail to show the nature and character of the work to be performed, including, but not limited to:

a.  Floor plans each floor level, 2 elevations and typical cross section:

b.  Copies of plot plans or copies of formal approved site plan as required by the code official, if applicable;

2.  Detached one and two family dwellings - alterations, small additions, miscellaneous structures:
Same as Number 1 above.

3.  New buildings, additions and alterations to buildings other than detached one and two family dwellings:

2 complete sets of architectural, structural, mechanical (heating, ventilation, air conditioning-HVAC) plumbing and electrical plans, drawn to scale with sufficient clarity and detail to show the nature and character of work to be performed.  The plans shall be prepared in compliance with this Code, and shall have the seal and signature of a Maryland state professional engineer or architect affixed to each and every sheet of all sets at least one of which shall bear the original (not reproduced) seal and signature.

(6)  109.6.  Refunds.  Delete subsection 109.6. and substitute the following:
109.6.  Refunds.  When an unissued permit has been denied by the building official or withdrawn by property owner or agent, a 50% refund is due on building codes and zoning fee paid.  No refund will be given on issued permits.

(7)  109.7.  Re-Inspection Fees.  Add a new subsection 109.7. to read as follows:
109.7.  Re-Inspection Fees.

A re-inspection fee may be charged for each re-inspection if the work has to be re-inspected because:

1.  The work was not ready for inspection at the pre-arranged time for inspection;

2. The inspector did not have access to the work at the pre-arranged time for inspection; or

3.  The inspector discovers a flagrant noncompliance during a requested inspection.
(8)
110.3.1.  Footing and Foundation Inspection.  Delete this section and replace with the following: 

110.3.1.  Foundation Inspection.  Foundation inspection shall be made when the foundation is complete with all required anchors, vents and termite shield installed.
(9)  110.3.3  Lowest Floor Elevation.  Delete this section. 
(10)  110.3.9.1  Coordination of Inspections.  Add a new subsection to read as follows: 
110.3.9.1 Coordination of Inspections.

All required inspections shall be made and coordinated with the other trades, building, electrical, plumbing, HVAC and Sprinkler.

(11)  110.5.  Inspection Request.  Amend section to include the following at the end of the first sentence:  "forty-eight (48) hours before said work is completed."
(12)  110.7.  Withholding of Inspection and Permit.  Add a new subsection to read as follows:  
110.7.  Withholding of Inspection and Permit.  

If the Code Official finds that a contractor, developer, or owner has violated the provisions of the Code, this title or rules or regulations which implement this title in connection with the construction, maintenance, alteration, or repair of any building, structures, equipment or land within the Town of Queenstown, the Building Official, after written notice to the violator, and a hearing on the allegations, if applicable, may refuse to grant further inspections or further permits of any kind to the contractor, developer, or owner until all violations have been corrected and all fees have been paid.
(13)  115.2.1.  Stop Work Order, Posting.  Add a new subsection to read as follows:  
Section 115.2.1.  Stop Work Order, Posting.  The posting of a stop work order at the job site shall constitute adequate notification by the Code Official. 
(14) 1607.12 Roof Loads.  Delete this subsection and replace with the following new text: 
Section 1607.12.  Minimum Roof Live Loads.  Roofs shall be designed for a minimum live load of 20 pounds per square foot or designed for the minimum snow load, whichever is greater.
(15) Section 1809.5.  Frost protection.  Delete Section 1809.5 and replace with the following:
Section 1809.5.  Frost protection.  Except where erected upon solid rock or otherwise protected from frost, foundation walls, piers, and other permanent supports of buildings or structures 120 square feet or larger in area or 10 feet in height shall extend below the frost line of 24" below finished grade, and spread footings of adequate size shall be provided where necessary to properly distribute the load within the allowable load bearing value of soil.  Alternatively, such structures shall be supported on piles where solid earth or rock is not available.  Footings shall not bear on frozen soils unless frozen condition is of a permanent nature.

Exception: Sheds under 300 square feet shall be permitted to be erected upon six (6) inches of compacted gravel base, provided they are anchored with approved anchors on all four corners.

(16) 3306.10.  Accessibility During Construction Operations.  Add new section titled as above to read as follows:  
3306.10.  Accessibility During Construction Operations.  During construction operations the contractor shall maintain at all times a vehicular roadway that will permit the unimpeded movement of emergency vehicles from the improved street to within 200 feet of the most remote building under construction on the site.  The vehicular access roadway surface shall be either crusher run, stone base, blacktop or other suitable compacted surface material approved by the Department.
Section 3.  One and Two Family Dwelling Code - Amendments.

The provisions of the International Residential Code for 1 and 2 family dwellings 2012 Edition as incorporated in COMAR 05.02.07 are modified, deleted, substituted, or added to as follows:

(1)  Chapter 1.  Administrative.

Chapter 1 of the International Residential Code for 1 or 2 family dwellings is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced with Chapter 1 of the International Building Code 2012 Edition as amended herein.

(2)  Section R - 301.2 

Climatic and Geographic criteria shall be amended so that Table #R301.2(f) shall read as follows:

TABLE R301.2(1)

CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA
           SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM:

	ROOF SNOW

LOAD
	
Grd   WIND  Snow  SPEED(c) Load  (MPH)
	SEISMIC

DESIGN

CATEGORY

(d)
	WEATHERING

(a)
	FROST LINE DEPTH (b)


	TERMITE


	DECAY


	WINTER 

DESIGN TEMP (d)
	FLOOD HAZARDS (e)

	20psf
	25psf   90/100 
	O
	Severe
	24"
	Moderate/

Heavy
	Slight to

Moderate
	75F
	3/21/92


FOR SI:  1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kN/m.0  , 1 mile per hour = 1.609 km/h.

a.  Weathering may require a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to satisfy the structural requirements of this code.  The grade of masonry units shall be determined from ASTM C 34, C 55, C 62, C 73, C 90, C l29, C 145, C 216 or C 652.

b.  The frost line depth may require deeper footings than indicated in Figure R403.1(1).  

c.  Wind exposure category shall be determined on a site specific basis in accordance with Section R301.2.1.4.

d.  The outdoor design dry-bulb temperature shall be selected from the columns of 97 ½ percent values for winter from Appendix D of the International Plumbing Code.  Deviations from the Appendix D temperatures shall be permitted to reflect local climates or local weather experience as determined by the building official.  

e.  (a) The date of the jurisdiction's entry into the National Flood Insurance Program (date of adoption of the first code or ordinance for management of flood hazard areas), (b) the date(s) of the currently effective FIRM and FBFM, or other flood hazard map adopted by the community, as may be amended.


(3)
Delete Sections R313.2 and R313.2.1 and substitute the following: 

Section R313.2.  Single family dwellings automatic fire systems.  Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall not be required to be installed in single family dwellings.   Notwithstanding, the foregoing, such systems may be installed at the option of the property owner of a single family dwelling.  For all other residential dwellings, including multi-family dwellings, automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall be required. 
Section R313.2.1.  Design and installation. Where applicable, automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall be designed and installed in accordance with Section P2904 or NFPA 13D. 

Section 4.  
Penalties.

(1)
Civil Penalties.

(a)  Any person who shall erect, construct, alter, extend, repair, move, remove, demolish or occupy any building, structure or equipment regulated by this Title, or cause the same to be done, in conflict with or in violation of any of the provision of this Title shall be guilty of a civil violation and subject to a fine of $250 for the first offense and $500 for each subsequent offense.  Each day shall be deemed to be a separation violation.   Enforcement of this section shall be in accordance with Article 23A, §3(b) of the Maryland Annotated Code, as amended from time to time.  This provision is not an exclusive remedy, and the Town may seek injunctive or other relief as necessary. 
(b)  Each day on which a violation continues constitutes a separate violation.

(2)
Collection of Civil Penalties.

(a)  Whenever, pursuant to this code, a building official directs a property owner to take an action to abate a violation of this code and the property owner fails to do so in the time frame set forth in the notice or pursuant to an order of the court, the building official may cause such action to be performed and the costs thereof shall be a lien against the real estate and shall be collectible in the same manner in which real estate taxes are collected, or the Town may collect it by such other action at law, in the Town’s discretion. 
Section 5.  Copies.  The Town Clerk/Treasurer shall keep one (1) copy of the International Building Code and International Residential Code for One-and Two-Family Dwellings in the town office. 
ORDAINED, APPROVED, AND PASSED by the Town Commissioners for the Town of Queenstown this _____ day of ___________________, 2012 by:

WITNESS:



TOWN COMMISSIONERS OF 






QUEENSTOWN:

_________________________
_____________________________

Amy Moore, Town Clerk

Perry A. Stutman, President

_________________________
_____________________________

Amy Moore, Town Clerk

Thomas B. Peregoy
_________________________
_____________________________

Amy Moore, Town Clerk

John M. Bowell
